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ACTION PLAN 2007- 2010*  

Revised as of January 2010  
 
PART 1 – STRATEGIC DEVELOPMENT TOPICS 
 
 
1. Economic Development/ Competitiveness  
 
1.1. Education  
 
AIM RESPONSIBLE TIME ACTIONS 
Network on 
education and 
innovation 
 

Nacka  Seminar in September 2007  
Brussels 2008 
Workshop in Getafe 2009 

 
 
 
2. Health – disease prevention  
 
2.1. Public Health 
 
AIM RESPONSIBLE TIME ACTIONS 
A public health 
group in order to 
create a 
professional 
network and 
submit  project 
application 
under the EU  
Public Health 
Programme 

Ballerup  Dormant for the time being. 
In readiness for a restart if and when 
the conditions change. 
 
 

 
2. 2 School & Health 
 
AIM RESPONSIBLE TIME ACTIONS 
Comenius - 
Lifestyle Project 

Ballerup  <  2008 Project is finished. 
Contacts and cooperation between 
schools continue and new projects 
should start again.  

 
AIM RESPONSIBLE TIME ACTIONS 
Drug prevention Getafe    
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3. Citizen and youth participation/e-government  
 
3.1. Children and Youth participation 
 
AIM RESPONSIBLE TIME ACTIONS 
    
Youth Network 
project 

Ballerup 2010-2011 Initial meeting in Ballerup April 2010 
“Summer Camp” in 2011 

 
4. Business and growth  
 
4.1. Innovation and entrepreneurship, InnoHubs 
 
Interreg Project 
InnoHubs 

• Nacka -  Lead 
Partner 

• Getafe 
• Ballerup 
• North Down 
• Loures  
• Pernik 

2010 - 2012 Kick-off meeting in Nacka January 
2010 
Next meeting in Loures September 
2010 
[The project Inno Hubs will have its 
own website with a layout matching 
ECN’s. Getafe’s undertaking.] 
 

 

PART II – STRENGHTENING THE NETWORK 
 
1. Members of the Edge Cities Network 
 
1.1 New Members 
 
AIM RESPONSIBLE TIME ACTIONS 
Getting new 
members 

All partners of the 
Edge Cities 
Network 

Until further 
notice  

Each Member should contact at least 
1 new potential member  
Nacka will contact Pernik 

 
1.2. Present Members 
 
AIM RESPONSIBLE TIME ACTIONS 
Strengthening 
the 
information/com
munication 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Getafe 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Nacka 

2008/2009 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
2010 

To send out Minutes/Reports shortly 
after the meetings. 
 
Develop a brief e-newsletter to be 
sent by the presidency to the 
members between the meetings 
(every third months) with news about 
the projects and activities in the 
Network 
 
 
The website has been worked upon 
to obtain a good layout and a better 
function. An improved User’s Guide 
as well as instructions on how to 
update the web has been sent to the 
partners. Each partner should send 
to Nacka the basic information to 
present in the web. 
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The current presentation ( PPT- 
presentation) should  be developed 
and updated. 

 
 
2.  Forum of Elected Members  
 
AIM RESPONSIBLE TIME ACTIONS 
Prepare a 
Handbook 

Ballerup The 
handbook is 
ready for the 
Getafe 
meeting. 
October 2008 
 
 
 
 
 
2009 

In order to identify the remits of each 
municipality and to identify other 
potential partners in the 
communities, the Edge Cities 
Network will produce Handbook with 
all information about different areas. 
 
Presentation of the Handbook 23 of 
October in Getafe 
 
 
To transform the handbook into an 
online version. Work is in progress at 
Ballerup 
 

 
 


